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Andale High School Fine Arts Addition & Garden Plain High School Gymnasium – Lockers Separate Contract 2009 
Andale, Kansas 

 
 
March 27, 2009 

 
 

Contractor BASE BID (AHS) ALTERNATE ONE 
Garden Plain High 

School Lockers 

      

Kansas Contract 
Design 

 $7,026.00 $28,571.00       

K.C. Bin Lockers 
 

 No Bid No Bid       

School Specialties No Bid No Bid       
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Andale High School Fine Arts Addition – Carpeting Separate Contract 2009 
Andale, Kansas 

 
 
March 27, 2009 

 
 

Contractor Addendums 1-2 
Rec’d 

BASE BID  ALTERNATE ONE  
Corresponds with GC 

Alternate One 

ALTERNATE TWO 
Upgrade Base Bid Carpet to 

F12A 

ALTERNATE THREE 
Upgrade All Areas Except 

Alt. 2 Areas 
Carpet Value  Yes $22,692.00 $1,355.00 $22,703.00 $13,074.00 

Floor Crafters 
 

 - No Bid No Bid No Bid  No Bid 

Fortney Tile - No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Kansas Carpet & Tile - No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Nuefeldt Flooring Yes  $28,438.99 $1,862.39 $11,615.32 $8,053.29 

Star Flooring & 
Decorating 

Yes  $19,816.00 $1,562.00 $14,195.00 $11,662.00 

 
 

     

 



                                                   

H A N N E Y   &   A S S O C I A T E S   A R C H I T E C T S 
1726 S. HILLSIDE     WICHITA, KANSAS  67211      (316) 683-8965         FAX (316) 684-1441    Email  HArchitect@AOL.Com 

 
 

 
 

Andale High School Fine Arts Addition – Stage Curtains Separate Contract 2009 
Andale, Kansas 

 
 

    March 27, 2009 
 
 

Contractor BASE BID     

Allied Theatre Crafts $29,436.00        

Capitol Stage 
Equipment Co. 
 

 No Bid       

Stagecraft Industries 
Inc. 

 $29,975.00       

T & M Stage Supplies  No Bid       

Theatrical Services Inc.  $24,742.00       
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Andale High School Fine Arts Addition – Music Equipment Separate Contract 2009 
Andale, Kansas 

 
 

    March 27, 2009 
 
 

Contractor BASE BID     

Mid-States School 
Equipment 

No Bid        

Wenger Corp. 
 

$155,237.00       

         

         

         

         

 
 

    

 



                                                   

H A N N E Y   &   A S S O C I A T E S   A R C H I T E C T S 
1726 S. HILLSIDE     WICHITA, KANSAS  67211      (316) 683-8965         FAX (316) 684-1441    Email  HArchitect@AOL.Com 

 
 

 
 

Andale High School Fine Arts Addition & Garden Plain High School Gymnasium – Sound System Separate Contract 2009 
Andale, Kansas 

 
 

    March 27, 2009 
 
 

Contractor BASE BID  (AHS) ALTERNATE ONE 
Garden Plain High 

School 

  

Commercial Sound No Bid  No Bid     

Electronic Contracting 
Co. 
 

$116,413.00  $63,769.00     

Kent Audio Visual  No Bid  No Bid     

McClelland Sound $104,139.00  $68,324.00     
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Andale High School Fine Arts Addition – Theatre Seats Separate Contract 2009 
Andale, Kansas 

 
 

    March 27, 2009 
 
 

Contractor BASE BID  ALTERNATE ONE 
Cast Aluminum Seats 

ALTERNATE TWO 
Standard Plastic 

Laminate End Panels 

Addendum 1 Rec’d 
(Y/N) 

Carroll Seating Co. No Bid  No Bid No Bid - 

Heartland Seating Inc. 
 

No Bid No Bid No Bid - 

Kansas Contract 
Design 

$89,581.45  No Change $1,078.00 Yes 

Mid-States School 
Equipment 

 $103,911.00 $10,206.50 $2,169.60 Yes 
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Andale High School Fine Arts Addition & Garden Plain High School Gymnasium – Wood Flooring Separate Contract 2009 
Andale, Kansas 

 
 

    March 27, 2009 
 
 

Contractor BASE BID  
(AHS)  

Addendum 
One Rec’d  

ALTERNATE ONE-A 
GPHS – Resilient  

Underlayment Floor 

ALTERNATE ONE-B 
GPHS – Duracushion  
1-3/8” Floor System 

ALTERNATE ONE-C  
GPHS – Duracushion  
1-5/8” Floor System 

Acme Floor Company $27,719.00  Yes $101,780.00 $105,800.00 $107,603.00 

Creative Floors 
 

 $36,484.20  Yes $117,237.86 $6,210.85 $7,596.77 

Great American Hardwood 
Flooring Co. 

$31,695.00  Yes $103,632.00 $108,643.00 $110,248.00 

Jarrett Enterprises  No Bid  - No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Lankford Enterprises  
(price does not include volleyball 

sleeves in slab) 

$34,200.00  Yes $113,800.00 $117,900.00 $120,900.00 

Sports Unlimited $26,200.00  Yes $106,900.00 $105,700.00 $107,600.00 

 
 

     

 


